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Google’s Sundar Pichai just announced ... Android boss
Sundar Pichai made the “HTC One with Nexus User
Experience” real. On the hardware side, it’s the same HTC
One we’ve come to know ...

“HTC One with Nexus User Experience” unveiled, will ship on
June 26
The first Android phone sold directly by Google to consumers.
This high-spec phone sports a 5-megapixel auto-focus
camera, high-resolution 3.7-inch touch OLED display, Wi-Fi,
HSPA 3G data ...

HTC Nexus One
Made by Sony Ericsson, the phone was based on Android,
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but it was a handheld gaming machine at its core. The phone
featured a slide-out controller with “joystick touchpads” so
you could play any of ...

We Miss These Quirky Android Phone Experiments
An Android smartphone and tablet brand from Google that
was "pure Android," meaning that there were no added user
interface ... Google sold the HTC-manufactured Nexus One
directly from its website.

Google Nexus
and the acquisition of mobile advertising network AdMob, as
well as the introduction of its Nexus One phone, it is clear that
Google not only intends to catch ... handset manufacturers
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such as HTC, ...

Google Android?s free model is biggest threat to Apple
iPhone
Some Android devices like the Samsung Galaxy S series,
Google Nexus series, Motorola Moto X and HTC One include
a shortcut on the Status bar drop-down menu that when
tapped enables or disables ...

How to Shut Off Bluetooth for Android
Google’s next Android build, likely named Android 5.0, will
feature a number of key changes. For one thing ... L Android
L also includes a big user interface redesign that focuses on
Google ...
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How to install Google’s awesome Android L update right now
Powered by a 1.2 GHz dual-core processor, the HTC
Sensation 4G is one of the fastest phones on ... sort of like
the Google Nexus S, though it is more subtle. Surrounding
the display is an aluminum ...

HTC Sensation 4G review
Known as the HTC Desire 530, it features a... According to an
update schedule leaked by Twitter user @llabtofer, the HTC
One M9 could be ... identical twin to the Nexus ...

Tag: htc desire
The midrange handset costs $449 while the Pixel Buds Pro
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come in at $199.

Google Android 4.0
When browsing the web, certain complex technologies are
disabled unless a website is marked as trusted by the user ...
since he picked up the HTC One S and later the Nexus 4.

You need to switch to iPhone if you want the best possible
protection from spyware
When Gadgets 4 Geeks gave us the opportunity to review a
KiDiGi Qi Wireless Charging Dock for the Nexus 7 (2013), we
leapt at the opportunity. There's a few of us at Ausdroid with
the Nexus 7 ...
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News and Editorial
For Android, Chrome was also available immediately for the
Google Nexus ... older HTC Evo phone. As my teenager
would say, “You can run Chrome on a three-year-old iPhone,
but not a one-year ...

Zeichick’s Take: With mobile, it’s all about the installed base
Clinician Nexus, a clinical workforce technology company,
announced enhancements to its innovative Provider
Performance Management Technology™ (PPMT™) that allow
for unique insight into the ...
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