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Going from good to
great is a process of
build up followed by
breakthrough. There
are three broad
stages. 1. Disciplined
People 2. Disciplined
Thought 3. Disciplined
Action Level 5
Leadership The type
of leaders required for
going from good to
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The findings of the
Good to Great study
will surprise many
readers and shed light
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of management study
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The study guide is
provided to guide you
through the course
material in a step by
step format. Reading
assignments are for
the book "Good to
Great" byJim Collins.
1) Good is the enemy
of great Reading
Assignment: Chapter
1 <<>> Review
Questions: #1-8. The
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As this good to great
study guide, it ends
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btgresearch.org
The key takeaway
from Good to Great is
discipline. To go from
a good organization to
a great one you need
disciplined people,
disciplined thought,
and disciplined action.
Disciplined people:
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means being honest
about the facts and
avoid getting
sidetracked.
Disciplined action:
means understanding
what is important to
achieve and what
isn’t. The key to
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Book Summary: Good
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Be able to quote the
opening sentence of
the book and explain
what it means. "Good
is the enemy of
great." When
someone is content
being "good" or
"mediocre," it seems
that the individual will
also never become
great. If an individual
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His concept of “good
to great” can be
applied to any type of
organization and to
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that began on par with
the prevailing market
and became great by
achieving major
increases of at least
three times that of the
market average
across a fifteen-year
period. The use of the
word “great,” since
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conversational usage
would suggest.

Good to Great
Summary |
SuperSummary
Good to Great is a
corporate strategy
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William Collins. Titled
in full as Good to
Great and why some
companies make a
leap, others don’t, the
book gives insight on
how to successfully
run a company. It also
gives real-life
examples of
companies that
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Good to Great
Summary |
GradeSaver
Good to Great by Jim
Collins. Cliff Notes.
Max Hodgen. Chapter
1 ? Good is the
Enemy of Great.
Theme of the book –
Discovering what
made good
companies great.
*Phase 1: The
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following basic
pattern: 15 years
cumulative stock
returns at or below
the general stock
market, punctuated by
a transition point, and
then cumulative stock
returns three times
higher than the
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Good to Great by Jim
Collins Cliff Notes
Max Hodgen
For more than a
quarter century, Jim
has studied what
makes great
companies tick. The
result is a series of
authored and
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Guide
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Breakthrough results
come about by a
series of good
decisions, diligently
executed and
accumulated one on
top of another. Create
an environment where
everyone hears the
truth and confronts
the
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