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the course. Subject
content. 1. Applied
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Director General.
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and an analysis and
evaluation of a
performance.. Visit
aqa.org.uk/8582 for
detailed information
about all aspects of NEA
administration. The
head of the school or
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I have just gotten my
results back from my
gcse in physical
education (full course)
with AQA and found
that I got 120/120 ums
for the theory. However,
I ap
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For Grade 9-1 GCSE
AQA PE exam success,
look no further than this
incredible Revision
Guide! It covers every
topic with crystal-clear
study notes and
examples, plus exam-
style practice questions
throughout the book
(with answers and mark
schemes at the back).
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bounce, overhead, use
of the fake.
Receiving/intercepting
– making a target
(signalling), one/two
handed catch, stationary
and on the move,
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up, set shot ...
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GCSE PE Full Course
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aqa Sample exam
questions You will be
taking a theory exam for
part of your GCSE PE
course and the paper
will contain a range of
questions across all the
subject content that you
have studied.
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